BERMUDA

BASE LANDS DEVELOPMENT AMENDMENT ACT 2010

2010 : 57

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Base Lands Development Act 1996;

Be it enacted by The Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and
consent of the Senate and the House of Assembly of Bermuda, and by the authority of the
same, as follows:

Citation
1 This Act may be cited as the Base Lands Development Amendment Act 2010.

Amends section 9 of 1996 Act

2 Section 9 of the Base Lands Development Act 1996 (leasing of land, etc.) is amended
as follows—

(@) in subsection (1)(b) by deleting “paragraph 12 of the First Schedule to the
1981 Act” and substituting “section 120(4) of the 1981 Act”;

(b) in the words at the end of subsection (1) by deleting “131 years” and
substituting “262 years”;

(c) in subsection (2) by deleting “131 years” and substituting “262 years”; and

(d) in subsection (3) by deleting “120 years” in both places and substituting
“the remainder of its lease”.

[Assent Date: 14 December 2010]

[Operative Date: 14 December 2010]




